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Fw: Project Approval 
1 message 

Supriya Vedagiri G <supriyavg2007@yahoo.co.in> To: "Dr R. SUNDARAGURU" <sugursg@sirmvit.edu> 

Forwarded message 
From: Supriya Vedagiri G <supriyavg2007@yahoo.co. in> 
To: qssabri123@gmail.com <qssabri123@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 28 November, 2019, 01:14:41 pm IST 
Subject: Fw: Project Approval 

--Forwarded message ---
From: Ganeshan <ganeshan@vjt.ind.in> 
To: Supriya Vedagiri G <supriyavg2007@yahoo.co.in> Sent: Monday, 25 November, 2019, 11:21:29 am IST 
Subject: Project Approval 

Dear Dr. Supriya Gopalakrishna Vedagiri, 

Greetings from "ViswaJothi Technologies Pvt Ltd." 

With reference to your project proposal titled "Unique Biometric Identification 
System for Multiple Applications" submitted on 30.09.2019, We examined the 
proposal based on the novelty, proposed objectives, work plan and 
methodology, publications, expertise of the investigator(s), etc. After scrutiny 
based on the above criteria it is decidedthat the proposal be considered for 
funding worth 2.1 lacs (Rupees Two lacs ten thousand). 

Regards, 

In this regard, an official approval letter will be sent to your official address. 
Kindly mail the account details to issue the cheque for the funded amount. 

Ganeshan V, 

DR.SUNDARA GURU <sugursg@sirmvit.edu> 

Managing Director 
ViswaJothi Technologies Private Limited 

Fri, Dec 6, 2019 at 11:39 AM 

Mob:9035043509 



Dear Dr. Supriya Gopalakrishna Vedagiri and Dr Kavitha G R, 

Date: 12.11.2020 

Greetings from ViswaJothl Technologies Pvt Ltd."n 
We are happy to inform that our technical committee was satisfied with the code designed for the funded project titled "Unique Blometric Identificatlon System for Multiple Applications" and second 
installment of fund, Rs.50,000/-(FIfty thousand only) Is released 
towards hardware Implementatlon. 

Also, as per Our discussion, you are informed to complete hardwara 
Emplesesatation and demonsíration by March 2021. 

Thanking you 
tith regards 

www.vit.ind.in 

P Shali 
Viswa Jothi Tecinologias Private Limited 

i4, 2"Floor, Near Anjaneya Temple, Arvind Nagar, Cil Mili Road, Bangalore -560 084, Ph 080 -4206 3278 



Mapping 
the 

Global 

Village 
CBK Infotech India (P) Ltd. 

Line ofResearch and Fundingby: 

Parking Automation Of A Large 
Facility Like Residential Block, 

Shopping Mall,College Campus Etc. 

CBK Infotech India Private Limited 

Start Date: 18/11/2019 

End Date: 17/11/2021 

Funding Approved for the Project: Two Lakh Rupees 
Duration of the Projeet: Twenty Four Months 

Principal Investigator: 

Dr. Kavitha G.R. 
Associate Professor 

# 5/3. ESS - CEE Butiding 
1 s! Cross. 12th Main 
M.S.R. Industria! Area 
Opp. Gotden Nes! P.G. 

Mathikere. Bangalore 560 054 
Tes :08 0 -2360 4 1 4 1 
Mob "91 9845 109606 

Www.cbktnloech..o 

Co- Principal Investigator: 

Department of Electronie and Communication Eagineering 
Sir. MVIT, Bengaluru, Karnataka, India 

Dr. Supriya V. G. 
Professor 

Departmcnt of Electronic and Communication Engincering 
Sir. MVIT. Bengaluru, Karnataka, India 

E-ma : adrrin Qcbkinkotech.coT 



Mapping 

the 

Global 

Village 
CBK Infotech India (P) Ltd. 

To, 
Principal 
Sir.M.V.J.T., 
Bengaluru, Karanataka 

Respected Sir, 

Pay: Principal, SIR.M.V.I.T, A/C 183110000011 
Bank: AXIS bank Itd 
Cheque number: 051073 
Dated: 28-09-2020 

Regards. 

5/3, ESS CEE Building 

CBK Infotech India Private Limited had partnered with faculties from your institute to a develop a project titled �Parking Automation of A Large Facility Like Residential Block, Shopping Mall, College Campus Etc.". Total funding approved for the project was Two Lakh Rupees (2,00,00.00 rupees) and | installment of fifty thousand rupees (Rs.50.000.00) was approved and released to 

chanda Bhushan 

1st Cross, 12th Mair 
M.S.R. Industrial Area 
Opp. Golden Nest P.G. 
Mathikere, 054 

As follow-up to this project, principal investigator Dr. G.R.Kavitha, Associate Professor, Dept. of E.C.E., Sir. M.V.I.T., and Co-Principal Investigator Dr. V.G.Supriya, Dept. of E.C.E., Sir. M.VI.T., had during a face to face meeting with our team on 26-Sep-2020, presented the progress achieved on project and discussed next progress steps. 

For CBK Infotech India (P) Ltd. 

Tel : 

We are satisfied with the progress achieved and what is being proposed as future project milestones. Hence, we are releasing second installment of the funding for sum of fifty thousand rupees (Rs.50,000.00). Please find cheque details below and the cheque attached with this letter. Further funding will be only on the satisfactory development of the project. 

NG ALORE 

Mob +91 - 984510960¬ 
E-mail : admin@cbkinfotech.com 
W W w.cbkin fo tech.in 

Date: 28-09-2020 

your institution on 13-Nov-2019. 



Sir.M:Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology Mail Re: Submission.. 

Silambu Chelvan <silambu.chelvanDpowerhealthtech.com> 

Re: Submission of Research Funding Project Proposal on" Designing 10T 
based Toolkit " 

To. vijay karthik <vijaykarthik_ is@sirmvit.eduP 
Cc, sundaraguru ramakrishnan <sugursg@gmail.com> 

Dear Mr. Vijay karthik, 

Good evening. 

Thank you for your time during the yesterday call to discUss on the finer details on the engagement approach, review frequency and the team availability etc and able to close al where clarifications requested. 

Pleased to inform you that, the submitted project proposal "Deslgning a IOT based Toolkit for industrlal 
Automation" has been duly reviewed and approved by our internal team since its relevance to our focused 
industry segment towards Irmproving the operation and maintenance optimization with last mile connectivity along mobility ennoblement, After the proposal review based our.our discussion, We are allocating INR 2 Lekhs (Two lakhs only) against the proposed projecd fee and look forward to take it forward 

Request you to initiate the project and suggest to have a kick off meeting with al the team members going to 
be involved in the project to have overall project orientation, progress updates, milestone review, Project schedule and roles & responsIblities etc. 

Regards, 

Let us complete the sald meeting in the next 10 days based on you/ your team avai!lability, let us know your 
confirmation to plan from our side too. 

Chelvan 

Look foward to he fruitful and outcome orienled engagement with you and Sir MVIT in the coming days 
ahead, 

+91 9900260176 

Dear sit, 

https:/mail.google.com/mailu0?ik-3cf793a39d& view-pt&seat.. 

On Wed, Jun 5, 2019 at 12:40 PM vijay karthik <vijaykarthik_is@sirmvit.edy> wrote: 

vijay karthik <vijaykarthlk_is@sirmvit.edus 

With kind Rogards, 

With respeci to our continuous discussions, here by we Professors Dr.P.Vijayakarthik and 
Dr.R.Sundaraguru are submitting a Research Project Proposal on " Designing l0T based Toolkit for 
industrial Automation". 1 kindly request you to review the Proposal so that we can add or modify any new 
Core Functianalty for the Rosearch funding Prcject we heve mentio:ed the Tine Line, Eudget anid 
Human Resourccs for the Project. 

Dr. P.Vijayekerthik. M.E., Ph.D., 

Vve have atached the soft copy of Proposal with this email and walting for your positive reply. 

Dr.R.Sundaraguru M.E.. Ph.D., 
Principal Investigators, 

Wed, Jun 19, 2019 at 4:23 
PMA 

Slr M Visvesvaraya lnstituto of Tochnology, 
International Alrport Road,Hunasamaranzhell, 
Bengaluru 562157, Karnataka, India. 
Landline : 080- 28467248 Extn: 155 

Mobile : 072596 93093,7019225711 
Einall :vijzykartihik_is @sirmvit.eúu , vijeyási986 ( grnai.ton 

20-06-209. 13:04 



Sit.M.Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology Mail Re: Submission.. 

2 or? 

Your Attempts may fail. But don't fail to make atte mpts. 

Thanks and Regards, 

Silarmbu Chelvan P 
PowerHealth Technologies 
Mob: +91 9900260176 

htps:/mail. googie.com/mail'w/0?ik 3cf793a39d&view-pt& sear... 

Email: Slambu.chelvan@powerhealthtech.com 

29-062019, 13:04 









Madhvendra Narayan 
Assistant Executive Director-ll 
(History of Science) 

Dear Madam, 

Sub : "Tithicintamani of Ganesa Daivajna � Translation and Mathematical Analysis" 

The recommendations are as follows: 

I am pleased to inform you that the above mentioned project has been renewed by the 
Indian National Commission for History of Science at the meeting of 16th September, 2020 
for the year 2020-21. 

Project renewed up to 31.7.2020 with the existing facilities for One Research Assistant 
@ Rs. 14000/ p.m. and Contingency & Travel of Rs 60000/ p.a. and institutional 
overhead of 10%. 

With regards, 

INDIAN NATIONAL SCIENCE ACADEMY 
Bahadur Shah ZafarMarg, New Delhl 110 002 

: 23221931 - 23221950 (EPABX); Fax: 91-11 
23231095,23235648 
9:ljhs@insa.nic.ln 

We shall be happy to receive the bill for the period April to July, 2020 along with a 
statement of expenditure/Audit Report (Utilization Certificate) for the period ending March 
2020 in the enclosed proforma. 

Dr. S.K., Uma 

In case of change of host institute, it should be intimated to INSA in advance and 
prior permission should be taken in this regard. 

Department of Mathematics 
Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology, 
Off International Airport Road 

No. RCI 

Hunasamaranahalli 

21 October, 2020 

Bengaluru-562157 

2. Deputy Executive Director-II (Finance & Admin.) 
3. Office Copy 

CC: 1. The Principal, Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology, Bengaluru 

Yours sincerely, 

Mo (Madhvendra Nafayan) 



Madhvendra Narayan 
AED-1I, (History of Science) 

Dear Dr. Uma, 

INDIAN NATIONAL SCIENCE ACADEMY Bahadur Shah Zafar Marg, New Delhi - 110 002 : 23221931 - 23221950 (EPABX); Fax: 91-11-23231095, 23235648 
9:jhs@insa.nic.in 

Ref: "Tithicint�mani of GaFe[a Daivajña -Translation and Mathematical Analysis" 

With kind regards, 

Dr S.K Uma, 

No. HS/RC/ 

I am pleased to inform you that the above mentioned project has been recommended by the Indian National Commission for History of Science at its meeting held on 29h March 2019 for one year, subject to submission of satisfactory Annual Progress Report. The exact recommendations for the financial year 2019-20 are as follows: 

Dated 20/OS/2019 

Recommended with the facilities of one Research Assistant Rs 14000/- p.m and Contingency & Travel of Rs 60000/- p.a. and Institutional Overhead as applicable. The duration was restricted to 1 year. 

If you accept the recommendation, kindly send us your Letter of Acceptance and a �No Objection Certificate" (NOC) from the Head of the Organization which is agreeable to operate the project fund on behalf of INSA. On receipt of your letter of acceptance and the NOC we shall be able to issue the sanction letter of the project to you with a copy to the Head of the host organization for information and necessary action. 

Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology, 
Hunasamaranahalli, Off International Airport Road, 
Bengaluru 562157 

Yours sincerely, 

(Madhvendra Narayan) 
AED-II, History of Science 



DR MAHESH SIRMVIT <drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu>

Sanction of sponsorship amount to the college bank account against the selected new
project proposal on Energy Conservation & Energy Efficiency or IoT.
5 messages

Kredl Ltd <kredl09ec@gmail.com> Mon, Dec 28, 2020 at 4:12 PM
Bcc: drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu

Dear Sir/ Madam,

With reference to the above subject, it is to inform your kindself that, the new project proposal submitted
by yours college is considered by KREDL and the 50% of the project cost or the maximum of Rs.
50,000=00 sponsorship amount has been credited to the bank account on 24/12/2020.   which was
submitted by the college.

Further, the balance 50% of the project cost or the maximum of Rs. 50,000=00 whichever is lower

shall be released in favor of the college authorities against the completion of the entire project, submission
of a copy of the project report, submission of the necessary bills for having purchased the items for the
project and a request letter addressed to the Managing Director, KREDL for releasing of the fund duly
certified and recommended by the college principal.

Hence,  it  is  requested  to  utilize  the  first  phase  sanctioned  amount  to  carry  the    project  on  Energy
Conservation & Energy Efficiency or IoT.

Thanks & Regards,

-----------------------------------------------------------------
Energy Conservation & Energy Efficiency Section
Karnataka Renewable Energy Development Limited
           

DR MAHESH SIRMVIT <drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu> Mon, Dec 28, 2020 at 4:33 PM
To: "Principal SIR.MVIT" <principal@sirmvit.edu>
Cc: SURESH HL <dr.hlsuresh_eee@sirmvit.edu>

Dear Sir,

I am Happy to  share this information that, Our new Project Proposal on "  Energy Conservation & Energy Efficiency or
IoT" submitted by 5th sem  electrical and electronics students , As been selected and  sum of Rs 1, 00,000/- ( Rupees one Lakh
only) Sponsorship  amount is been  granted for execution of this project from KREDL.  
The amount is released in two Phases, as part of first phase  Rs 50,000/- , is credited to the principal account.
In this regard , I like to thank yourself( Principal) and HOD-EEE dept for the support and Encouragement. 
The Email confirmation is attached herewith.

Regards, 
Dr. Mahesh. K
Professor, Department of Electrical & Electronics Engineering
Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology
Krishnadevaraya Nagar,
Hunasamaranahalli, Yelahanka,
Bangalore-562157.
M:9900119252
E-mail(P):dr.maheshkgowda@gmail.com
E-mail(O):drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu
[Quoted text hidden]

DR MAHESH SIRMVIT <drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu> Mon, Dec 28, 2020 at 4:39 PM
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To: srikrishnadevaraya educationaltrust <sriket@gmail.com>, Prabhakar <prabhakar@saathitelecom.com>

Dear Sir,

I am Happy to  share this information that, Our new Project Proposal on "  Energy Conservation & Energy Efficiency or
IoT" submitted by 5th sem  electrical and electronics students , As been selected and  sum of Rs 1, 00,000/- ( Rupees one Lakh
only) Sponsorship  amount is been  granted for execution of this project from KREDL.  
The amount is released in two Phases, as part of first phase  Rs 50,000/- , is credited to the principal account.
In this regard , I like to thank SriKET Management , Principal , Academic Chairman and HOD-EEE for the support and
Encouragement. 

The Email confirmation from KREDL of the amount granted and deposit of the first phase amount is attached .

Regards, 
Dr. Mahesh. K
Professor, Department of Electrical & Electronics Engineering
Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology
Krishnadevaraya Nagar,
Hunasamaranahalli, Yelahanka,
Bangalore-562157.
M:9900119252
E-mail(P):dr.maheshkgowda@gmail.com
E-mail(O):drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Kredl Ltd <kredl09ec@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Dec 28, 2020 at 4:08 PM
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

DR MAHESH SIRMVIT <drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu> Fri, Oct 28, 2022 at 3:48 PM
To: Bhaskarcsiet@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Kredl Ltd <kredl09ec@gmail.com>
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

DR MAHESH SIRMVIT <drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu> Mon, Apr 17, 2023 at 9:10 AM
To: Sumalatha ELECTRICAL <sumalatha_eee@sirmvit.edu>

Greetings of the day,
PFA
Regards, 
Dr. Mahesh. K
Professor, Department of Electrical & Electronics Engineering
Sir M Visvesvaraya Institute of Technology
Krishnadevaraya Nagar,
Hunasamaranahalli, Yelahanka,
Bangalore-562157.
M:9900119252
E-mail(P):dr.maheshkgowda@gmail.com
E-mail(O):drmaheshk_eee@sirmvit.edu

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Kredl Ltd <kredl09ec@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Dec 28, 2020 at 4:08 PM
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
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